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Supplementary Figure 1 Countries in which participants carry out research projects, with 
darker colours including regions where more participants stated they have expertise. The minimum 
number of participants in any country is four, as four participants stated they carry out research 
with a global reach. Map created in QGIS v.3.16, with base maps from Natural Earth. 
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Supplementary Figure 2 Description of the participants. (a-b) Number of participants with 
expertise in each SDG taking part in the online questionnaire (step one, a) and the group synthesis 
exercise and workshop (step two and three, b). Participants according to (c-d) their expertise, (e-f) 
their gender and (g-h) the income category of their region of employment. Values exceed the total 
number of participants as online questionnaire participants (n=102) could provide responses for 
several SDGs, according to their expertise. The content of this publication has not been approved 
by the United Nations and does not reflect the views of the United Nations or its officials or 
Member States (https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/). 

https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/
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Supplementary Figure 3 Positive and negative impacts of RAS on targets from SDG1-2. The 
distribution of participant responses to whether RAS would have an impact on each target. 
Percentage values indicate the proportion of negative, neutral and positive scores. “Do not know” 
values were excluded. N(+) and n(-) indicate the total number of participants’ answers on the 
positive (+) and negative (-) impact of RAS on each target. The content of this publication has not 
been approved by the United Nations and does not reflect the views of the United Nations or its 
officials or Member States (https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/). 

 

https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/
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Supplementary Figure 4 Positive and negative impacts of RAS on targets from SDG3-4. The 
distribution of participant responses to whether RAS would have an impact on each target. 
Percentage values indicate the proportion of negative, neutral and positive scores. “Do not know” 
values were excluded. N(+) and n(-) indicate the total number of participants’ answers on the 
positive (+) and negative (-) impact of RAS on each target. The content of this publication has not 
been approved by the United Nations and does not reflect the views of the United Nations or its 
officials or Member States (https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/). 
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Supplementary Figure 5 Positive and negative impacts of RAS on targets from SDG5-6. The 
distribution of participant responses to whether RAS would have an impact on each target. 
Percentage values indicate the proportion of negative, neutral and positive scores. “Do not know” 
values were excluded. N(+) and n(-) indicate the total number of participants’ answers on the 
positive (+) and negative (-) impact of RAS on each target. The content of this publication has not 
been approved by the United Nations and does not reflect the views of the United Nations or its 
officials or Member States (https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/). 

https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/
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Supplementary Figure 6 Positive and negative impacts of RAS on targets from SDG7-8. The 
distribution of participant responses to whether RAS would have an impact on each target. 
Percentage values indicate the proportion of negative, neutral and positive scores. “Do not know” 
values were excluded. N(+) and n(-) indicate the total number of participants’ answers on the 
positive (+) and negative (-) impact of RAS on each target. The content of this publication has not 
been approved by the United Nations and does not reflect the views of the United Nations or its 
officials or Member States (https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/). 

https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/
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Supplementary Figure 7 Positive and negative impacts of RAS on targets from SDG9-10. 
The distribution of participant responses to whether RAS would have an impact on each target. 
Percentage values indicate the proportion of negative, neutral and positive scores. “Do not know” 
values were excluded. N(+) and n(-) indicate the total number of participants’ answers on the 
positive (+) and negative (-) impact of RAS on each target. The content of this publication has not 
been approved by the United Nations and does not reflect the views of the United Nations or its 
officials or Member States (https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/). 
 

https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/
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Supplementary Figure 8 Positive and negative impacts of RAS on targets from SDG11-12. 
The distribution of participant responses to whether RAS would have an impact on each target. 
Percentage values indicate the proportion of negative, neutral and positive scores. “Do not know” 
values were excluded. N(+) and n(-) indicate the total number of participants’ answers on the 
positive (+) and negative (-) impact of RAS on each target. The content of this publication has not 
been approved by the United Nations and does not reflect the views of the United Nations or its 
officials or Member States (https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/). 
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Supplementary Figure 9 Positive and negative impacts of RAS on targets from SDG13-14. The 
distribution of participant responses to whether RAS would have an impact on each target. 
Percentage values indicate the proportion of negative, neutral and positive scores. “Do not know” 
values were excluded. N(+) and n(-) indicate the total number of participants’ answers on the positive 
(+) and negative (-) impact of RAS on each target. The content of this publication has not been 
approved by the United Nations and does not reflect the views of the United Nations or its officials or 
Member States (https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/). 

https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/
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Supplementary Figure 10 Positive and negative impacts of RAS on targets from SDG15-16. 
The distribution of participant responses to whether RAS would have an impact on each target. 
Percentage values indicate the proportion of negative, neutral and positive scores. “Do not know” 
values were excluded. N(+) and n(-) indicate the total number of participants’ answers on the 
positive (+) and negative (-) impact of RAS on each target. The content of this publication has not 
been approved by the United Nations and does not reflect the views of the United Nations or its 
officials or Member States (https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/). 
  

https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/
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Supplementary Figure 11 Positive and negative impacts of RAS on targets from SDG17. The 
distribution of participant responses to whether RAS would have an impact on each target. 
Percentage values indicate the proportion of negative, neutral and positive scores. “Do not know” 
values were excluded. N(+) and n(-) indicate the total number of participants’ answers on the 
positive (+) and negative (-) impact of RAS on each target. The content of this publication has not 
been approved by the United Nations and does not reflect the views of the United Nations or its 
officials or Member States (https://www.un.org/sustainabledevelopment/). 
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